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BID NO: 060-42-07-050-61 OPEN: 5/3/07 ITEM: VEHICLE FILTERS-BISMARCK JBUYEF:' SUE EBERLE
Brand Name: ’
NAPA GOLD NAPA AUTO Brand Name* PETERBILT OF |
ATP Vendor PARTS BALDWIN  |Vendor BISMARCK  |Vendor. |Vendor.
Item Brand Name/ Brand Name/
No. Description Quantity Numbers Unit price: Total: Numbers Unit price Total Unit price. Total Unit price:
1|Wix 24073 12 4073MP 9.35 112.20 BW 5139 7.40 88.80
2|Wix 24428 6 4428 5.30 31.80 BW 5178 4.27 25.62
3|Wix 33183 6| 3183 5.90 35.40 BF 7719 4.92 29.52,
4/ Wix 33239 6 3239 418 25.08 BF 984 3.36 20.16
5]W|x 33248 6 3248 3.32 19.92 BF 7693 2.83 16.98
6|Wix 33311 12 3311MP 5.21 62.52 BF 1171 4.91 58.92 ]
7/Wix 33336 6 3336MP 5.22 31.32 BF 888 4.80 28.80
8| Wix 33338 6 3338 5.88 35.28 BF 588 4.35 26.10 |
9/Wix 33352 6 3352MP 3.39 20.34 BF 970 273 16.38 ! |
10/Wix 33369 6 3369 9.29 55.74 BF 912 7.49 44.94 | |
11]Wix 33415 6 3405MP 7.14 42.84 BF 1212 5.55 33.30 ‘ i
12{Wix 33472 6 3472MP 5.35 32.10 BF 1226 5.38 32.28 |
13|Wix 33481 12 3481MP, 5.19, 62.28 BF 853 4.89 ) 58.68|
14| Wix 33537 6 3537 11.69 70.14 BF 7674D 7.15 42.90|
15/Wix 33579 6 3579MP 5.27 31.62 BF7658 5.21 31.26 ]
16| Wix 33595 6 3595MP 4.15 24.90 BF 7668 417 25.02, !
17/Wix 33644 6 3644 8.43 50.58 BF 7773 5.49 32.94
18/Wix 33651 6 3651 4.80 28.80 PF 7680 3.98 23.88
19|Wix 41061 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid |No. Bid
20| Wix 42491 2 2491 31.20 62.40 PA 2525 25.25 50.50
21|Wix 42651 2 2651 18.00 36.00 PA 2526 15.94 31.88
22/Wix 42808 2 2808 45.13 90.26 RS4634 30.45 60.90
23|Wix 46035 2 6035 5.53 11.06] PA 4107 4.35 8.70 “
24| Wix 46077 2 6077 447 894  PA2163 303 7.86 -
25/Wix 46117 2 6117 5.58 11.16| PA 2257 6.07 12.14
| 26|Wix 46302 2 6302 4,99 9.98| PA 2231 4.64 9.28
27\Wix 46406 2 6406 7.27 14.54[ PA 4088 7.96 15.92|
28|Wix 46433 2 6433 18.77| 37.54| RS 2863 14.49 28.98 ]
29'Wix 46617 2 6617 38.44 76.88| PA 2797 3370 67.40
30|Wix 46814 2 6814 8.98 17.96] No Bid |No. Bid
31|Wix 51036 12 1036MP 242 29.04| B355 213 25.56
32|Wix 51040 12 1040MP 242 29.04| B435 2.13 25.56|
33|Wix 51042 12 1042 2.94 35.28 B31 3.03 36.36)
34 Wix 51060 12 1060MP| 2.42 29.04| B1428 2.36 28.32
35/Wix 51061 12 1061MP| 2.42 29.04| B6| 2.16 25.92,
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‘ { Brand Name- [ | ; )
NAPA GOLD NAPA AUTO Brand Name: PETERBILT OF
} ‘ ATP ‘Vendor' PARTS BALDWIN |Vendor | BISMARCK [Vendor. J Vendor
Item ‘ Brand Name/ Brand Name/ |
No. Description Quantity Numbers Unit price: Total: Numbers Unit price. Total’ Unit price: ‘ Total’ Unit price.
36/Wix 51068 | 12 1068MP| 2.34 28.08 B233 2.09/ 25.08 | |
37|Wix 51085 | 12 1085MP| 2.49 29.88 B34 2.31| 27.72 | ]
38/Wix 51158 | 12 1158| 522 62.64 B7031 6.07| 72.84 | | l
39 Wix 51243 y 12 1243MP] 273 32.76 BT259 2.43| 29.16 |
40/Wix 51348 12 1348MP)| 2.36 28.32 BT223 220, 26.40 |
41|Wix 51372 12 1372MP 2.57| 30.84 B329 2.43] 29.16 1
42|Wix 51515 12 1515MP 2.27! 27.24 B2 2.0 24.00 |
| 43/Wix 51516 | 12 1516MP| 2.42| 29.04 B243 274 32.88 { Bl
44|Wix 51607 | 12 1607MP| 3.42] 41.04 BT339 2.74 32.88 ‘
45|Wix 51747 6 1747| 7.55| 45.30 B309 6.01] 36.06 |
46|Wix 51772 6 1772 4.28 25.68 B236 3.44 20.64] ] r
| 47Wix 51791 12 1791MP| 4,63 55.56) B7600] 3.75 45.00 | | -
48/Wix 51792 [ 12 1792MP| ~ 9.09 109.08 B99)| 7.03 84.36 [ | -
49|Wix 51799 12 1799MP 12.48 149.76 B7030| 9.92 119.04 | |
50|Wix 518343 2 1833 13.52 27.04 BD7166| 12.28 24.56 \ |
51|Wix 51860 7 6 1860 11.06] 66.36] BT388-10] 10.70 64.20 i ! e
52|Wix 57082 ; 6 7082 3.00] 18.00 P1445 2.70 16.20 | |
53|Wix 57415 ] 6 7415 17 35| 104.10 PT8452] 13.71 82.26 y
| 54|Wix 57703 | 6 7703 15.90| 95.40 BC7242 9.66 57.96 |
55|Wix 57740 ; 12 7740XE 38.99| 467.88| PT8515MPG|  32.52 390.24 i
56/Wix 57746 | 6 7746XD 23.66] 141.96 BD7154/ 18.72 112.32 |
| 57|Wix 58607 ; 2|(ATP) 1-9767 9.85 19.70 18056 8.85 17.70] | B
| 58|WIX 58608 | 2 1-9755 14.88 29.76( 18027| 14.04 28.08 ﬁ |
59/Wix 58611 | 2 I-7797 14.16 28.32 18057 10.83 21.66 |
60|Wix 58613 | 2 1-9756 10.73 21.46 18055 7.28| 14.56 |
61/Wix 58815 2 1-9742 14.05 28.10 18034 9.47 18.94 |
| 62|Wix 58904 i 2 1-9729 10.40 20.80 18010 8.33 16.66 |
63|Wix 58917 2 1-9733 13.35 26.70 18007 9.89 19.78 |
64/Wix 58918 2 No Bid No Bid 18022 7.36 14.72 | B
65|Wix 58934 2 1-9725 7.91 15.82 18004 6.38 12.76 ]
66/Wix 58955 2 1-9751 12.40 24.80 18029/ 9.61 19.22
67|Wix 58968 2 1-9739 16.52 33.04| 18265, 14.00 28.00
68/Wix 58995 | 6 1-9754 13.21 79.26 18268 12.39 74.34 B !
TOTAL FOR AWARD 3244.74 2711.14 | ;
TOTAL FOR LOW BID LESS ; ;
__I"NOBIDS" Al or Nothing 3226.78 2696.42 | |
[Discount on items not listed 50% | 57% f | ]
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