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BID NO: 060-42-07-050-68 OPEN: 5/10/07 ITEM: VEHICLE FILTERS-FARGO BUYER: SUE EBERLE
HASTINGS BERG AUTO NAPA AUTO TRUCK UESCO
PREMIUM {VENDOR. SUPPLY NAPA (WIX) |VENDOR: PARTS VENDOR|/UTILITIES|BALDWIN VENDOR:; WAREHOUSE

Item Brand Name/ Brand Name/ Brand Name/ Brand Name/

No. Description Qty Numbers | Unit price Total: Numbers Unit price Total: Numbers |Unitprice, Total Numbers Unit price Total
1|Wix 24071 30 WC6 4.50 135.00 4071MP 4.93 147.90 NO BID BW5137| 4.64 139.20
2!Wix 24428 10 WC3| 414 41.40 4428 4.77 47.70 NO BID BS5178| 4.27 42.70
3|Wix 33109 6 FF945 2.43 14.58 3109MP 2.78 16.68 NOBID] BF957| 2.51 15.06
4/Wix 33336 4] FF986 4.65 18.60 3336MP 4.70 18.80 NO BID BF888| 4.80 19.20
5|Wix 33338 7 FF828 4.22 29.54 3338 5.29 37.03 NO BID BF588| 4.35 30.45
6|Wix 33341 5 FF985 3.46 17.30 3341 4.06 20.30 NO BID BF979 3.57 17.85
7|Wix 33352 3 FF984 265 7.95 3352 3.21 9.63 NO BID BF970 273 8.19
8|Wix 33370 6 FF996 4.68 28.08 3370 5.30 31.80 NO BID BF909| 482 28.92
9/Wix 33403 8 FF1074 417 33.36 3403 4.93 39.44 NO BID BF7629| 4.30 34.40

10 Wix 33415 6 FF863 5.39 32.34 3405MP 642 38.52 iNO BID BF1212 5.55 33.30
11|Wix 33442 7 FF1073 6.33 44.31 3442 10.80 75.60 NO BID BF5813 6.52 45.64
12|Wix 33644 10 FF1153 532 53.20 3644 7.50 75.00 NO BID BF7773 5.49 54.90
13|Wix 33674 4 FF1056 580 23.20 3674MP 7.12 28.48 NO BID BF7537 5.98 23.92
14\Wix 42222 2 AF129K 7.62 15.24 2222 8.63 17.26 NO BID PA1667-FN 7.85 15.70
15\Wix 42253 10 AF608| 18.84 188.40 2233 21.15 211.50 NO BID PA2521| 19.41 194.10
16|Wix 42254 4 AF609 12.39 49.56 2254 14 10 ~ 56.40 NO BID PA2522| 12.77 51.08
17| Wix 42491 8 AF594! 2451 196.08 2491 28.06 224.48 NO BID PA2525| 25.25 202.00
18|Wix 42651 2 AF610| 15.48 30.96 2651 16.19 32.38 NO BID PA2526| 15.94 31.88
19|Wix 42714 12 CB11 1.91 22.92 2714 2.19 26.28 NO BID PA1704 1.97 23.64
20|Wix 42808 6 AF2374| 29.22 175.32 2808 40 59 243.54 NO BID RS4634| 30.45 182.70
21|{Wix 46617 3 AF2233, 32.71 98.13 6617| 3457 103.71 NO BID PA2797{ 33.70 101.10
22|Wix 46870 4 AF2357| 23.02 92.08 6870 27.03 108.12 NO BID RS4636| 23.71 94.84
23!/Wix 46871 4 AF2358| 21.91 87.64 6871] 21.94 87.76 NO BID RS4637| 22.62 90.48
24|Wix 46882 8 AF797| 33.11 264.88 6882 37.86 302.88 NO BID PA2680| 34.10 272.80
25|Wix 51061 4 LF224 2.06 8.24 1061MP 2.18 8.72 NO BID B6 215 8.60
26|Wix 51068 10 LF196 2.03 20.30 1068MP 2.11 21.10 NO BID B233 2.09 20.90
27 |Wix 51243 9 LF340 2.36 21.24 1243MP 2.45 22.05 NO BID BT259 243 21.87
28|Wix 51407 3|  HF757 4.57 13.71 1407 5.20 15.60 NO BID PT707-HD10| 4.71 14.13
29{Wix 51515 5 LF115 1.92 9.60 1515MP 2.04 10.20 NO BID B2 1.99 9.95
30|Wix 51747 14 LF241 583 81.62 1747 6.79 95.06 NO BID B309 6.02/ 84.28
31|Wix 51748 18 LF448| 14.12 254.16 1748MP| 15.84 285.12 NO BID BD103| 14.55| 261.90
32|Wix 51749 1 LF439 7.91 7.91 1749MP 9.10 9.10 _|NO BID B7577 8.15| 8.15
33|Wix 51759 2 HF738 4.91 9.82 1759 5.62 11.24 NO BID BT287-10| 5.05 10.10
34|Wix 51784 4 LF361 3.31 13.24 1784MP 3.54 14.16 NO BID BT261 3.42 13.68
35{Wix 51790 10 LF260 3.50 35.00 1790 3.52 35.20 NO BID PT546 3.61 36.10
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HASTINGS ’ BERG AUTO NAPA AUTO TRUCK UESCO
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Item Brand Name/ | Brand Name/ Brand Name/ Brand Name/ |
No. Description Qty. | Numbers | Unit pnice Total Numbers Unit price Total Numbers |Unit price| Total Numbers Unit price Total
36|Wix 51791 6 LF531 3.52 21.12 1791MP 416 24.96 NO BID B76 3.62 21.72
37|Wix 51792 4 LF282 6.82 27.28 1792MP 8.18 32.72 NO BID B99 7.03 28.12
38|Wix 51799 6 LF284 9.62 57.72 1799MP 11.23 67.38 NO BID B7030 9.92 59.52
39|Wix 51860 21 HF769| 10.38 217.98 1860 9.95 208.95 NO BID BT388-10| 10.70 224.70
40|Wix 57703 6 KF54 9.37 56.22 7703 14.31 85.86 NO BID BC7242 9.66 57.96
41Wix 57706 12 KF51 9.76 117.12 7706/ 12.69 152.28 NO BID BC7228| 10.06 120.72
PT8515-MPG Kit
42|Wix 57740 6 HF998| 31.57 189.42 7740 28.07 168.42| {NO BID (2/Kit)] 3253 195.18
43|Wix 57744 4 LF597| 16.77 67.08 7744 17.55 70.20 NO BID BD7250| 16.55 66.20
44 /Wix 57745 6 LF498| 24.45 146.70 7745XD 28.13 168.78 NO BID BD7153! 25.19 151.14
45 | Wix 57746XD 6 LF499 18.17 109.02 7746XD 2129 127.74 NO BID BD7154| 18.72 112.32
ITOTAL. 3184.57 3636.03 3281.29
Discount on items 61% 55% 57%
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